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The Oklahoma Constitution and Bill of Rights are the foundation of the
state's legal system. These documents establish the framework for
government, protect the rights of citizens, and define the relationship
between the state and its people.

The Constitution was adopted in 1907, shortly after Oklahoma became a
state. The Bill of Rights was added to the Constitution in 1965. Both
documents have been amended several times over the years, but their
core principles remain the same.

This article provides a comprehensive overview of the Oklahoma
Constitution and Bill of Rights. We will discuss the history of both
documents, their structure, and their key provisions. We will also explore
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the ways in which the Constitution and Bill of Rights have shaped
Oklahoma law and society.

History of the Oklahoma Constitution

The Oklahoma Constitution was drafted in 1906 by a constitutional
convention composed of 112 delegates. The delegates were elected by the
people of Oklahoma, and they represented a wide range of political views.

The convention met in Guthrie, Oklahoma, and debated the proposed
Constitution for several months. The final draft of the Constitution was
adopted by the convention on July 16, 1907, and it was ratified by the
people of Oklahoma on September 17, 1907.

The Oklahoma Constitution has been amended several times over the
years. The most significant amendments were made in 1965, when the Bill
of Rights was added to the Constitution. Other amendments have been
made to address issues such as taxation, education, and government
reform.

Structure of the Oklahoma Constitution

The Oklahoma Constitution is divided into 26 articles. Each article deals
with a specific topic, such as the legislative branch, the executive branch,
the judicial branch, and the rights of citizens.

The first article of the Constitution contains the Declaration of Rights. This
article guarantees the fundamental rights of all Oklahoma citizens,
including the right to life, liberty, and property. The other articles of the
Constitution establish the framework for government and define the powers
of the different branches of government.



Key Provisions of the Oklahoma Constitution

The Oklahoma Constitution contains a number of key provisions that have
shaped the state's law and society. These provisions include:

* The right to life, liberty, and property * The right to bear arms * The right to
freedom of speech, religion, and the press * The right to due process of law
* The right to a fair trial * The right to vote * The right to education * The
right to healthcare

These provisions have been interpreted by the Oklahoma courts to protect
the rights of citizens and to ensure that the government operates in a fair
and just manner.

History of the Oklahoma Bill of Rights

The Oklahoma Bill of Rights was added to the Constitution in 1965. The Bill
of Rights was drafted by a legislative committee and was approved by the
voters of Oklahoma in a statewide referendum.

The Bill of Rights contains 21 sections that guarantee the fundamental
rights of all Oklahoma citizens. These rights include the right to privacy, the
right to equal protection under the law, and the right to a clean and healthy
environment.

The Bill of Rights has been interpreted by the Oklahoma courts to expand
the rights of citizens and to protect them from government overreach.

Key Provisions of the Oklahoma Bill of Rights

The Oklahoma Bill of Rights contains a number of key provisions that have
shaped the state's law and society. These provisions include:



* The right to privacy * The right to equal protection under the law * The
right to a clean and healthy environment * The right to freedom of
information * The right to a fair trial * The right to vote

These provisions have been interpreted by the Oklahoma courts to protect
the rights of citizens and to ensure that the government operates in a
transparent and accountable manner.

The Oklahoma Constitution and Bill of Rights are the foundation of the
state's legal system. These documents establish the framework for
government, protect the rights of citizens, and define the relationship
between the state and its people.

The Constitution and Bill of Rights have been amended several times over
the years, but their core principles remain the same. These documents
continue to shape Oklahoma law and society, and they serve as a reminder
of the importance of individual liberty and the rule of law.
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